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Placement and Internships

Capgemini’s 2022 placements were completed and the results
were declared on 28th October 2021. The students from XIE
selected for the Software Analyst position with a package of
4LPA are: Zara Fatima Qureshi, Adish Shivdikar, Reetik Gupta,
Nishant Tushar Bhatte, Mihir Prasad Shirke, Sharan Ashok
Shetty, Yash Anil Mistry, Merlyn Joseph Koonamparampath,
Dhruv Shailesh Darji, Karan Krishna Umredkar, Vipul Kashyap,
Ankur Vibhakar Foujdar, Sachin Arvind Dwivedi, Suraj Satish
Rane, Nimeesha Venkatavelu, Melisa Andrea Soans, Sheldon
Santosh Noronha, and Dixit Pravin Patel from IT Department.

Capegemini has shortlisted 13 students out of the 40 CG final
selects for the Junior analyst’s role. These 13 students were
shortlisted for the Sr. Analyst role with a salary of 7.5 LPA. They
will appear for the programming test followed by a technical
interview next week.

eClerx 2021 campus placement for the 2021 batch of students
was conducted last week. Mr. Abhishek Sharma has been
selected for the role of data analyst. He has been offered a
salary of INR 4 LPA.



TCS’ interview process phase 2 for Ninja and digital roles
started from 1st November 2021. The results of phase 1 were
declared on 7th November 2021. 32 students from XIE were
selected for the TCS ninja role with a salary of 4 LPA. These are:
Megha Verma, Levina Pegado, Daniel Barretto, Mahipa
Sundvesha, Zara Fatima Qureshi, Sachin Dwivedi, Nikhil Lad,
Lincy Lois Brian, Heeba Shaikh, Sheldon Noronha, Joshua
Miranda, Sara Tuscano, Neil Pinto, Jay Panchal, Ishwar Vodnala,
Srushti Rane, Shubhashree Sur, Bala Aakash Reddiar, Rose
Paattam, Jessintha Matthew, Saurabh Kayasth, Rohan Patil,
Khushdeep Kaur Nagi, Lisa Dsa, Muthu Jyothika, Aditya Patil,
and Wasimhaider Sayed.

Prof. Chhaya Narvekar attended an online workshop on
“Analysis using SPSS- a foundation course for researchers” on
29th October 2021 organized by Rehoboth Academic Services,
Bengaluru.

Prof. Jaychand Upadhyay successfully completed an AICTE
Training And Learning (ATAL) Academy Online Elementary
FDP on "Emerging trends in area of Data Science" from 12-16
November 2021 at the Institute of Engineering and Technology,
MJP Rohilkhand University.

Achievements



The Information Technology Department (IT) of XIE is going for
NBA Accreditation. The Department had submitted a pre-
qualifier to NBA on 21st September 2021, and finally submitted
the Self Appraisal Report (SAR) on 25th November 2021. The
next step is a visit from NBA. The IT Department is grateful to
Director, Fr. (Dr.) John Rose S.J. and Principal, Dr. Y.D. Venkatesh
for their relentless support and guidance, and also to the entire
teaching and non-teaching staff of XIE, all of whose generous
contribution and efforts made it possible for the SAR submission
to go through smoothly
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